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Home Help Loq off

<« Process Bids
Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

Number of Document Name

I (s
Product Category End Date
Financial Amount Type Cluster

Status

EGAT

Processed by Me

W

W

All Bids from My Company

UJ

Region

[ & |

|4 |

Start|  Simple Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number

Search Result: 6 Hits

Number Name Tvp
7000000227 ivlsa. wawi-si. (1)) 15/2559 Sales bid
7000000225 rlsa. wawi-w. (7.) 142558 Sales bid
7000000223 rvlsa. wawi-sa. (&) 092550 Sales bid
7000000193 rvlsa. wawi-si. (&) D6/2559 Sales bid
7000000192 rlsa. wawi-sa. (&) 05/2559 Sales bid
7000000191 Frlsa. a3 (a1.) 04/2559 Sales bid

e

g=UULAAY Sales Bid Invitation Ng9laDNNIMUAIULIASTL

Start Date

End Date
05.07.2016 1
05.07.2016 1
05.07.2016 1
07.11.2016 1
07.10.2016 1

12.12.2016 1

2:00:00
2:00:00
2:00:00
7:00:00
7:00:00
7:00:00

Bid Status
Mo Bid Created

Mo Bid Created
Mo Bid Created
Mo Bid Created
Mo Bid Created

Mo Bid Created

Bur.Detail Action

=)

sirunswilavias nostannas i AesEn Tud e
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wiiAENIVAR nasviARnas Ehar

sirunTwlavias nostARna G

sirunEnilavian nostanna thavinnuaedas

[ T e A

wiuATwMLeAe nosiARnA EhuWARuAssen Tudwwe

Legend: % Display Bid |:| Create Bid ;3 Display Auction VQ’? Change Bid ] Delete Bid

N15LaUasIAT AANLRINUNaUlalNans taziaanle
¥ o o £ -
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Home Help Log off EGAT

« Display Sales bid

O R ., I N | Create | Qutput Preview Back to Initial S¢

Sales bid: Name awvla. waw-a. (7.) 06/2559 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 2

ltem Data

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | Pariner/Delivery Address

Check the information for the bid invitation. Y C=J
General Data: Tayanabiluas
End Date 07.11.2016 17:00:00
Opening Date 09.11.2016 02:00:00 S I B 'd I 't t'

Currency THB Thai Baht a eS I nVI a Ion
Fimancial Amount Type 4

Fimancial Amount Description  dsennasienisuEwaite diupi 2 uAuirm

Cluster

Region

Purchasing Details ueuATwheWAR AosiARnas thiviAauArSen lulmme

Purchase Order Document Date
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Home Help Loq off

« Display Sales bid
| Create |

NushviAREu | Output Preview |

Sales bid: Name awlai. s, (7.) 06/2559 Number 7000000193  External Version Number 2

carsaiosa [ )

EGAT

Back to Initial Screen

[] Display Documents

Item Overview
¢ Find Hem
Item Description Item Category Product Category
1 #ah Material e L gy

2 mewmnadin Material

N

VARG

ltem Data: $78N15RUAN

LAZANUIY

Page 9

) Attachments Notes ) )
Quantity (buyerime) (buyerime) Requirad Action
100 Each 0/ 0 0 / 0|on &
20 Each 0/ 0 0/ 0/on &

Legend :'Js Display item details '@ Change price
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Logon

VRNULAG
Website iaaguwém%m Browser |E w32 Firefox
asila 1E 9 duld Tidan Tools =Compatibility View

User | |

Password L ] \
Client (200 |

Language 921 User LAz
[Log On]

Password LLﬁQﬂaﬂ
11 Log On

Change Password

Forgot your password or user ID? H

NMUIANNTHR

fuunihms s rumsianaesvuddansaing min.

Uszmannasim/ @ousim

Uszmesimnandalanalaeiideunm
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Home Help Log off

EGAT

4« Process Bids

eusnvEeli Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
Number of Document Name Status Processed by Me
| = | v v
Product Category End Date All Bids from My Company
]
Financial Amount Type Cluster

Region

[ | | ¢4 |

dch
Start| Simple Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number

Search Result: 3 Hits
Number Name Typ Start Date End Date Bid Status Pur.Detail Action
7000000193 [PGE00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Sales bid 07.11.2016 17:00:00 Mo Bid Created i
7000000192 PGEO0 07.06.2016 10:55:43 Sales bid 07.10.2016 17:00:00 Bid submitted '35 ﬁ?
7000000191 PGEOD 06.06.2016 12:20:08 Sales bid 12.12.2016 17:00:00 No Bid Created ]

- - . -
Legend: "* Display Bid LJ Create Bid }2 Display Auction V%? Change Bid Delete Bid

g=UULAAY Sales Bid Invitation NgI9 3D

MMUUAIULASTUNISLAUDSIAT ARNLAUNITUTN

aulaiNansgaziasn
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Home Help Log off EGAT

« Display Sales bid

O R ., I N | Create | Qutput Preview Back to Initial S¢

Sales bid: Name awvla. waw-a. (7.) 06/2559 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 2

ltem Data

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | Pariner/Delivery Address

Check the information for the bid invitation. Y C=J
General Data: Tayanabiluas
End Date 07.11.2016 17:00:00
Opening Date 09.11.2016 02:00:00 S I B 'd I 't t'

Currency THB Thai Baht a eS I nVI a Ion
Fimancial Amount Type 4

Fimancial Amount Description  dsennasienisuEwaite diupi 2 uAuirm

Cluster

Region

Purchasing Details ueuATwheWAR AosiARnas thiviAauArSen lulmme

Purchase Order Document Date
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Home Help Loq off

« Display Sales bid
| Create |

NushviAREu | Output Preview |

Sales bid: Name awlai. s, (7.) 06/2559 Number 7000000193  External Version Number 2

carsaiosa [ )

EGAT

Back to Initial Screen

[] Display Documents

Item Overview
¢ Find Hem
Item Description Item Category Product Category
1 #ah Material e L gy

2 mewmnadin Material

N

VARG

ltem Data: $78N15RUAN

LAZANUIY

Page 15

) Attachments Notes ) )
Quantity (buyerime) (buyerime) Requirad Action
100 Each 0/ 0 0 / 0|on &
20 Each 0/ 0 0/ 0/on &

Legend :'Js Display item details '@ Change price
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Logon

VRNULAG
Website iaaguwém%m Browser |E w32 Firefox
asila 1E 9 duld Tidan Tools =Compatibility View

User | |

Password L ] \
Client (200 |

Language 921 User LAz
[Log On]

Password LLﬁQﬂaﬂ
11 Log On

Change Password

Forgot your password or user ID? H

NMUIANNTHR

fuunihms s rumsianaesvuddansaing min.

Uszmannasim/ @ousim

Uszmesimnandalanalaeiideunm
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Home | e | Lagof EGAT

4« Process Bids

ey Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
udwshviagltes

Number of Document Name Status Processed by Me
| = | v v
Product Category End Date All Bids from My Company

[Nextvear V] m

%A;OUMTYPE ﬂaﬂl,aﬂﬂl;ﬂmﬁq’]uﬁ -]

Simple Search

ADINISLAURSTIAN

Tip: Choose a symbol in the
Search Result: 3 Hits

Number e Typ Start Date End Date Bid Status Pur.Detail Action

PGBOD 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Sales bid 07.11.2016 17:00:00 Mo Bid Created i
7000000192 PGEO0 07.06.2016 10:55:43 Sales bid 07.10.2016 17:00:00 Bid submitted ‘35 ﬁ?
7000000191 PGEOD 06.06.2016 12:20:08 Sales bid 12.12.2016 17:00:00 No Bid Created i

- - . -
Legend: "* Display Bid LJ Create Bid }2 Display Auction V%? Change Bid Delete Bid
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Home | teb | Logof EGAT

1« Display Sales bid

us et aglduda Create Output Preview Back to Initial Screen

ﬂ a ﬂ ﬂ N les bid: Name PGG0007.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 1
Q

Data || Information from Purchaser | Parner/Delivery Address

1] 1)
C re ate the information for the bid invitation.

Time Zone UTC+7

End Date 07.11.2016 17:00:00
Opening Date 09.11.2016 09:00:00
Currency THB Thai Baht
Financial Amount Type 4

Financial Amount Description
Cluster

Region

Purchasing Details

Purchase Order Document Date 20160623
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Page 21

Home Help Log off
1« Process Bid
Submit| | Hold | Check| |Refresh| Download | | Upload | |Outpul Preview

Sales bid: Name PGG60007.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193

External Version Number 1

EGAT

Back to Initial Screen

Basic Data|| Information from Purchaser |

Bid Number
Time Zone

End Date
Opening Date
Bid Status

Total Value (Net)

Incoterm / Loc ation

Terms of Payment
Currency

Created on

Last processed on

Financial Amount Type

Financial Amount Description

Chicter

2000000993

UTC+7

07.11.2016 17:00:00
09.11.2016 09:00:00

Parlné'rr;m,..\‘-id:esu Bid Invitation Versions

Check the information in your bid. You can also add your ow

= (=)
EAANLLNU

“Item Data’

0.00 Thai Baht

[ ||

THB Thai Baht
23.06.2016 16:55:17 by =awany awauy
23.06.2016 16:55:17 by #atha Auduiy

[+ ]

Supply and procurement Division
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EGAT
1« Process Bid

ey TR E L) |Submit. Hold | Delete| Check||Refresh| Download UpIoad||Outpul Preview

Back to Initial Screen

Sales bid: Name PGG00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193
General Data Item Data

Tip: (1) You can enter values directly in the tables and press Submit button on the top, or you can go to the details of each item by clicking the item number or detail icon and then submit
your bid.

External Version Number 1

(2) You cannot submit bids directly on items with conditional pricing, or items with required attributes.
O Display Documents

Item Overview

} Find ltem

ltem Description Item Category Product Category SQUE;:;‘:\T igﬁ;gmﬂig}s (bur:rc;lr?;e) Price Required Action
1 dsh Material VAR wuE? 100 Each 0o/ o 0/ 0 I:ITHB Per On Q,
2 sewanadin | Material A g nuud? Each 0/ o o

T T

Legend :""s Display item details @Change price

a a o o = a v
2. ARNNATAUITIENITN 1. TTUITIAINABINIT

ARINISLULLANANS LA UANTRY “Price”
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Home | ek | Lagof EGAT

¢ Process sida
Submit| | Hold | Delete| Check||Refresh| Download UpIoadHOutpulPreview Back to Initial Screen

nudwdsiEsldu

Sales bid: Name PG00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 1

General Data Ilem Data

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser || My Notes || Partner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue » Back to ltem Overview

ltem Detail 1: sui

ltem Category Material

Vendor Product Number |

Product Category HARITIMYAR
Quantity of Bid Invitation 100 Each

Submitted Quantity 100 Each ﬂ a ﬂ Laﬂ ﬂ ‘ My N Ote”
Price (5000 |ThaiBahtPd o, o 'Y N

fom Value 500000 THB D1ARINIS LEUAAINNTD
Delivery Time (Duration) l:l Days
Required at O0:00:00 wuutand@1slsznaunig

| & |

Incoterm

|

Binding Time(Days)

LAUBTIAN
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Home Help Log off EGAT
1 Sales bid: Name PGG00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193  External Version Number 1
NuswiovaAelT A

General Data Ilem Data

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address ¢« Back Continue > Back to ltem Overview
Item Detail 1: sai
Texts

STULNDAMNLAUDLNNLAN

dususialnszyludas

“Price” LN114U

Attachments

Upload a Document:

escription L I13 " =
zath p | Browse... < ﬂ ﬂ’J; 3\' Browse La\lﬂ
[Add |

ADINISUULLANANS

1lsznauni1siduas1nan

Page 24
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4 Sales bid: Name PGG00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 1

Nus A

EGAT

General Data Item Data

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address

« Back Continue » Back to ltem Overview

-

Item Detail 1: sah (& Choose File to Upload
Texts @n\:‘)v| » Documents - |+¢ | | Search Documents jol [
Bidder's Remarks
Organize * Mew folder ==« 0l @
¢ Favorites Mame ° Date modified Type
ﬁ_ PdfView 7/6/2559 14:41 Adobe Acrobat D...
=l Libraries
& Documents
—. Music
| Pictures = P d' 'Y
B v lnantnalang1sNnaInNg
_'l'i. Computer o I~ .
S SYSTEM (C3) ﬂ 73 O ””
UL LAIAANLN pen
"T‘I_-l Metwork
Attachments
Upload a Document: ] m b
Description File name: v |l -
Path [ Open ] | Cancel |
Add

Page 25

Supply and procurement Division



o A d
ANIMSITHIIIMNUTIHNYMIYIZUUIAINTDUN

)
Dy L A
Do’

5
&

Home Help Log off EGAT
1 Sales bid: Name PGG00 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Number 7000000193 External Version Number 1
w Al
General Data Ilem Data
Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue s Back to ltem Overview

ltem Detail 1: suh

Texts

Bidder's Remarks

2. 1uaaaIn1sLRu g
AANLy “Add”

[ o
1. ssuLLAnItayalWan

ARINITULUL IUTRY “Path”

Attachments

Upload a Document:

Description | |

Path |C-\Users\a426610\DesktopiDocumd  Browse...

[Add]
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Home

|
:

EGAT

¢ Item Detail 1: sal

A " Texts
ua s AT

Bidder's Remarks

'Y ¢
WINABINITAU IWANLLLL
lauaraan luaantlw
ANURUITIENISNARING

= o ! (1] 7
AULAIAANLN “Delete

]

Browse...
Category Wersion Processor Typ File Size (Kb Changed By Changed on
Standard Attachment 1 if 42 3310501 23.06.2016 16:59:45
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Home Help Log off

Process Bids

Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

Number of Document Name Status Processed by Me

| = | | v
Product Category End Date All Bids from My Company

O]

Financial Amount Type Cluster Region

[ & | |4 | *

Start| Simple Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Search Result: 3 Hits

Number Name Typ Start Date End Date Bid Status Pur Detail
7000000193 PGEO0 07.06.2016 10:58:22 Sales bid 07.11.2016 1?:00:00
7000000192 PGEO0 07.06.2016 10:55:43 Sales bid 07.10.2016 17:00:0 submitted
7000000191 PGEO0 06.06.2016 12:20:08 Sales bid No Bid Created

(HagIN L AURTIAETALTELSDARAT F2UUAY
WARITAAIH “Bid submitted” TuARANY “Bid

Status™ 19512015 NHU 8 bALAUAsIAT

EGAT

Action

Qw
Qw

| Create Bid ;E Display Auction »37 Change Bid Delete Bid
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Logon

VRNULAG
Website iaaguwém%m Browser |E w32 Firefox
asila 1E 9 duld Tidan Tools =Compatibility View

User | |

Password L ] \
Client (200 |

Language 921 User LAz
[Log On]

Password LLﬁQﬂaﬂ
11 Log On

Change Password

Forgot your password or user ID? H

NMUIANNTHR
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Home Help Loq off EG AT

<« Process Bids

MuEnARITRA Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
MNumber of Document Mame Status Processed by Me
| || | v v
Product Category End Date All Bids from My Company
dYear n
Financial Amount Type Cluster Region

L. | L |

Start|  Simple Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Search Result: 6 Hits

Number Name Tvp Start Date End Date Bid Status Pur.Detail Action
7000000227 rwls. ssawn-sa. (1) 15/2559 Sales bid 05.07.2016 12:00:00 No Bid Created sirunswilsias fosiaanas & AEaE T Tane 1
7000000225 rln. wawi-w. (8.) 142559 Sales bid 05.07.2016 12:00:00 No Bid Created wUATWMLNIYAS nosiARnAs Thavidnusedamn Tudweane ]
7000000223 rwln. waw-. (&) 092559 Sales bid 05.07.2016 12:00:00 Mo Bid Created wemndwinaiAe nosiARna thaviAnuaeden Tutsene |':|
7000000193 sl swawi-sa. (2.) DB/2559 Sales bid 07.11.2016 17:00:00 Bid submitted RHUATWNIYIAS AosRARNAY FhaviARkAesavn Tutwane % W i |
7000000192 rwls. swawi-ss. (&) 0502559 Sales bid 07.10.2016 17:00:00 Bid submitted ELARWILEVIAR ABSWARAAY ENaviAGsREREn e y W il
7000000121 rols. ssaw-ws. (7.) 042559 Sales bid 12.12.2016 17:00:00 No Bid Created wssuATwniAn nosARnas shavimssesen Tudwmame |':|

Legend: "1 Display Bid I—:| Create Bid fi Display Auction ﬁ Chg

Aan & taninisun la
T1ANURY Sales Bid
Invitation ﬁéfmmﬁ
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<« Process Bid
JRSE SRS X 1 | Submit [ Hold | Check| | Refresh | | Download | | Upload | | Output Preview Back to Initial Screen
S
a 1 “Item Data”
3 ﬂ@n Sales bid: Name rwia. waviw. () 062559 Number 7000000193 . L@’I’Jﬂ e a a
General Data Ilem Data
(s 1# | Tip: (1) You can enter values directly in the tables and Submit butt number or detail icon and then submit your bid
u bmlt ip: (1) You can enter values directly in the tables and press Submit button m number or detail icon and then submit your bid.

(2) You cannot submit bids directly on items with conditional pricing, or items with required atiributes.

Il Display Documents

Item Overview

»_Find Item_

. Submitted Aftachments Notes - ) )

ltem Description Item Category Product Category Quantity (buyerime) (buyerime) Price Required Action
1 dinh Material viseluada 100 Each 0/ 1 071 ||au:.u|: [rH8 Per [1 | on &
2 mewanARA Waterial viagldnuud 20 Each [V o/ a |T|:.D|: |THB Per | | On Q&

Legend :"s Display item details @ Change price

2. unlusiAn
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